NOTICE OF BID AWARD

February 12, 2015

To Whom It May Concern:

This shall advise you that the Board of Acquisition and Contract on February 11, 2015 accepted the bids of January 21, 2015 for furnishing the following to Broome County:

BID TITLE: Inmate Clothing

BID #: 2015-001 CA #: 12-388

AMOUNT: Est. NTE \$75,000.00 Per Attached Pricing

TERM: 2/1/2015 to 1/31/2017 – One Optional Renewal thru 1/31/2018

Purchase order(s) will be forthcoming upon receipt of a certificate of insurance in compliance with the insurance requirements as stated in the specifications. **Incorrect insurance certificates will cause delays in payment.**

If you have not submitted the proper insurance certificate, please send/fax a copy to Robert Murphy, Risk Manager, Broome County Office of Risk Management, County Office Building, 3rd Floor, 60 Hawley Street, P.O. Box 1766, Binghamton, NY 13902-1766. Phone: (607) 778-2402 Fax #: (607) 778-6009

IMPORTANT: Please include the bid title and bid number on the insurance certificate.

Sincerely,

John A. Flynn, Jr.

Director of Purchasing

John J. Flynn, Jr.

JAF:snr

Attachment(s)

CC: Sheriff David Harder

Ray Holdrege, Sheriff's Department Fiscal Manager

Broome County Office Building . 60 Hawley Street . P.O. Box 1766 . Binghamton, New York 13902 Phone: (607) 778-2188 . Fax: (607) 778-2346 . www.gobroomecounty.com

AWARDED VENDORS:

Bob Barker, Inc. 134 N. Main Street

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 800 Number: 888.772.0250 Email: aprilp@bobbarker.com

Charm Tex

1618 Coney Island Avenue Brooklyn, NY 11230 800 Number: 800.221.3147 Email: Stan@charm-tex.com

ATD American Co 135 Greenwood Avenue Wyncote, PA 19095

800 Number: 800.523.2300 Email: American@ATD.com

Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.

PO Box 12716

Scottsdale, AZ 85267 800 Number: 800.222.1474 Email: jacq@umidirect.com

Broome County Sheriff's Office RFB-2015-001 Inmate Clothing Bid Summary

							Unit Price					
		Unit/Pkg.	Bob			ICS Jail	ATD-	Victory		Uniforms Mfg.	!	
Item	Size	Size	Barker	OD Taragin	Charm-Tex	Supplies	American	Supply	Security	ju J	Award To:	Basis for Award
						-						
	,					000	100	7 00 0	600	7 00	rodrea dea	triborg red bid licroise treme
Women's Underwear, white	n i	nozen	ر م م	81.48			7.30	1,03	0.32		pob barker	Lowest over all bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	اف	nozen	5 5 6 7 6 7	9.18	7.18	9.93	0.7	7.03	26.0	7 7	Dob Barker	Lowest over all bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	,	nozen	מאַ	9.18	7.10	3.35	0.70	7.03	20.0	7.00	DOD DANKE	cowest over all old for product
Women's Underwear, white	œ	Dozen	6.99	9.18	8.54	9.93	85.7	90.7	28.87	7.80	Bon Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	o)	Dozen	6.39	9.72	8.54	10.63	× × × × × × × × × × × × × × × × × × ×	8.31	9.76	7.80	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	8	Dozen	8.49	9.72	8.54	10.63	8.48	8.31	9.76	08'/	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	H	Dozen	8.49	10.27	9:36	12.01	8.48	8.94	9.76	7.80	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	17	Dozen	8.49	10.27	9.36	12.01	8.48	8.94	10.60	7.80	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	Ħ	Dozen	8.49	10.27	9.36	12:01	9.28	8.94	10.60	7.80	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Women's Underwear, white	14	Dozen	8.49	10.81	9.90	12.76	9.28	8.94	10.60	7.80	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sport Bras, white	32-38	Dozen	17.99	21.67	21.90	28.44	19.44	21.12	25.76	19.82	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sport Bras white	40-46	Dozen	17.99	23.84	21.90	31.01	20.52	21.12	27.75	19.82	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sport Bras white	48-54	Dozen	19.99	29,36	21.90	35.04	23.16	21.74	30.24	19.82	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Crew Socks, White	 !.	Dozen	4.99	5.65	5.72	6.28	4.48	5.63	6.22	5.14	ATD-American	Low Bid
					4							
	. :	-1		1			710	Ų	() 2	4 05	i colered de d	to book and bird illeration to the second
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	Small	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	5.48	NO BIO	6.15	DIG ON	0.00	bob barker	Lowest over all pid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	Small	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	5.48	No Big	6.15	NO BIG	0.4	boo barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	Small	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	NO BIG	4.50	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	Small	Each	4.59	69.6	No Bid	6,48	No Bid	6.64	No Big	C. 14.	800 Barker	Lowest overall pla for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	Med	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	Med	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	Med	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	Med	Each	4.59	9.69	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.64	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
White Stripe	Large	Each	4.59	9.69	No Bid	6,48	No Bid	6.64	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	1X Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	1X Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	1X Large	Each	4.59	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.15	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	1X Large	Each	4.59	9.69	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.64	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	2X Large	Each	5.09	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.39	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	2X Large	Each	5.09	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.39	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	2X Large	Each	5.09	7.83	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.39	No Bid	4.60	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	2X Large	Each	5.09	69.6	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.93	No Bid	4.95	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	3X Large	Each	5.09	8.10	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6:33	No Bid	5.40	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	3X Large	Each	5.09	8.10	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6:33	No Bid	5.03	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	3X Large	Each	5.09	8.10	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.39	No Bid	5.03	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
& White Stripe	3X Large	Each	5.09	10.06	No Bid	6.48	No Bid	6.93	No Bid	5,40	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	4X Large	Each	5.79	8.32	No Bid	7.13	No Bid	6.75	No Bid	5.40	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	4X Large	Each	5.79	8.32	No Bid	7.13	No Bid	6.75	No Bid	5.03	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	4X Large	Each	5.79	8.32	No Bid	7.13	No Bid	6.75	No Bid	2.03	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
& White Stripe	4X Large	Each	5.79	10.28	No Bid	7.13	No Bid	7.36	No Bid	5.40	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	6X Large	Each	5.79	9.57	No Bid	8.43	No Bid	7.23	No Bid	5.90	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
	6X Large	Each	5.79	9.57	No Bid	8.43	No Bid	7.23	No Bid	5.48	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product

Broome County Sheriff's Office RFB-2015-001 Inmate Clothing Bid Summary

							Unit Price					
		Unit/Pkg.	Bob			ICS Jail	ATD-	Victory	Norment	Uniforms Mfg.		
Item	Size	Size	Barker	OD Taragin	Charm-Tex	Supplies	American	Supply	Security	ınc	Award To:	Basis for Award
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	6X Large	Each	5.79	9.57	No Bid	8.43	No Bid	7.23	No Bid	5.48	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	6X Large	Each	5.79	11.75	No Bid	8.43	No Bid	7.92	No Bid	5.90	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Orange)	8X Large	Each	5.79	10.44	No Bid	9.73	No Bid	7.59	No Bid	6.45	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Blue)	8X Large	Each	5.79	10.44	No Bid	9.73	No Bid	7.59	No Bid	5.98	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Tan)	8X Large	Each	5.79	10.44	No Bid	9.73	No Bid	7.59	No Bid	5.98	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
V-Neck Shirt (Red & White Stripe	8X Large	Each	5.79	12.72	No Bid	9.73	No Bid	8.49	No Bid	6.45	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	Small	Each	No Bid	26.11	14.90	27.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.09	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	Medium	Each	15.89	26.11	14.90	27.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.09	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	Large	Each	15.89	26.11	14.90	27.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.09	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	1X Large	Each	15.89	26.11	14.90	27.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.09	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	2X Large	Each	15.89	26.11	14.90	27.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.09	Charm-Tex	
Denim Work Jackets	3X Large	Each	15.89	27.41	15.90	29.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.55	Charm-Tex	
Denim Work Jackets	4X Large	Each	16.89	27.41	16.90	29.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	16.55	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	5X Large	Each	17.89	28.50	17.90	30.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	18.17	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	6X Large	Each	19.59	28.50	18.90	30.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	18.17	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Denim Work Jackets	7X Large	Each	19.59	29.75	19.90	32.03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19,94	Charm-Tex	Lowest overall bid for product
Pants Orange	Med-8XLg	Each	6.29	6.77	No Bid	8.53	No Bid	7.75-8.25	No Bid	7.00	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Pants Blue	Med-8XLg	Each	6.29	8.23	No Bid	8.53	No Bid	7.75-8.25	No Bid	6.75	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Pants Tan	Med-8XLg	Each	6.29	9.81	No Bid	8.53	No Bid	7.75-8.25	No Bid	6.75	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Pants Red & White Striped	Med-8XLg	Each	6.29	8.78-12.31	No Bid	8.53	No Bid	8.58-9.15	No Bid	7.00	Bob Barker	Low Bid
ide O deed a cada service and a	u	ņ	22	NO BIA	454	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5.53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Close-Orange w/ Since back Only	า น	rico.	2 22	N CN	4.54	451	No Bio	4.34	No Bid	5.53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Clogs-Orange W/Shoe back Only	۸ د	Dair Dair	2 22	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5,53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Close-Orange W/Shoe Back Only	. oc	, in	333	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5,53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Closs-Orange w/Shoe Back Only) on	Pair	3.33	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5.53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Closs-Orange w/Shoe Back Only	101	Pair	3.33	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5.53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Clogs-Orange w/Shoe Back Only	Ħ	Pair	3.33	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5.53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Clogs-Orange w/Shoe Back Only	12 & Up	Pair	3.33	No Bid	4.54	4.51	No Bid	4.34	No Bid	5,53	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Tee Shirts, White	Small	Dozen	22.99	22.64	18.99	25.54	15.48	17.94	20.97	15.60	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Tee Shirts, White	Medium	Dozen	22.99	22.64	18.99	25.54	15.48	17.94	20.97	15.60	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Tee Shirts, White	Large	Dozen	22.99	22.64	18.99	25.54	15.48	17.94	20.97	15.60	ATD	
Tee Shirts, White	1X Large	Dozen	22.99	22.64	18.99	25.54	15.48	17.94	20.97	15.60	ATD	
Tee Shirts, White	2X Large	Dozen	22.39	24.81	27.90	29.59	20.48	27.89	24.33	20.15	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Tee Shirts, White	3X Large	Dozen	27.99	29.16	27.90	33.65	23.68	27.89	27.69	22.10	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Tee Shirts, White	4X Large	Dozen	27.99	31.33	47.90	35.20	26.68	34.91	28.81	31.20	ATD	
Tee Shirts, White	5X Large	Dozen	31.99	32.68	48.90	37.80	26.98	36.91	31.05	32.50	ATD	
Tee Shirts, White	6X Large	Dozen	31.99	33.77	56.90	39.30	29.48	39.91	32.17	35.10	ATD :	Lowest overall bid for product
Tee Shirts, White	7X Large	Dozen	35.99		69.90	40.81	33.98	68.44	36.86	39.10	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Briefs, White	Small-XL	Dozen	11.09	10.08	9.30	11.45	9.18	10.88	9.97	10.40	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
Briefs, White	2x-3XI.	Dozen	11.99	12.26	11.54	13.84	11.28	12.08	11.82	12.35	ATD	
Briefs, White	4x-6xl	Dozen	14.09	15.28	14.18	17.82	14.48	14.23	15.57	15.60	ATD	Lowest overall bid for product
	1	4	į	730	TIE CIV	0.00	Cia Cia	5 97	Zig CN	8.67	Rob Barker	lowest overall hid for product
Sweatshirt, Gray	Medium		5.69	9 8	No Bid	9.28	No Bid	5.97	No Bid	8.67	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
משכם ואוויי כים				!								

Broome County Sheriff's Office RFB-2015-001 Inmate Clothing Bid Summary

						U	Unit Price					
		Unit/Pkg.	Bob			ICS Jail	ATD-	Victory	Norment	Uniforms Mfg.		-
item	Size	Size	Barker	OD Taragin	Charm-Tex	Supplies	American	Supply	Security	<u>ה</u>	Award To:	Basis for Award
Sweatshirt, Grav	Large	Each	5.69	8.64	No Bid	9.28	No Bid	5.97	No Bid	8.67	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Gray	1X Large	Each	5.69	8.64	No Bid	9.28	No Bid	5.97	No Bid	8.67	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Grav	2X Large	Each	5.69	9.34	No Bid	11.01	No Bid	7.19	No Bid	9.34	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Gray	3X Large	Each	6:79	10.21	No Bid	12.20	No Bid	7.19	No Bid	9.34	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Gray	4X Large	Each	7.79	10.76	No Bid	13.08	No Bid	7.97	No Bid	10.36	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Grav	6X Large	Each	10.09	12.00	No Bid	15.21	No Bid	8.74	No Bid	12.38	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Sweatshirt, Gray	8X Large	Each	10.89	13.88	No Bid	17.34	No Bid	11.98	No Bid	13.06	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts. Navv	Small	Each	3.59	5.89	3.90	3.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.21	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts, Navy	Medium	Each	3.59	5.89	3.90	3.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.21	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts, Navy	Large	Each	3.59	5.89	3.90	3.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.21	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts, Navv	1X Large	Each	3.59	5.89	3.90	3.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.21	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts, Navy	2X Large	Each	3.59	5.89	3.90	3.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.21	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gvm Shorts, Navy	3X Large	Each	3.79	5.89	4.18	3.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.49	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gym Shorts, Navy	4X Large	Each	3.99	5.89	4.36	4.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	4.49	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gym Shorts, Navy	6X Large	Each	29.9	6.43	4.90	4.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.00	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Gym Shorts, Navy	8X Large	Each	7.16	6.43	5.90	5.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5.36	Bob Barker	Lowest overall bid for product
Mattresses		Each	28.79	No Bid	33.90	42.96	No Bid	No Bid	36.28	No Bid	Bob Barker	Low Bid
												Prev. use of Bob Barker product
Pillows		Each	4.09	No Bid	4.33	7.31	No Bid	No Bid	5.58	No Bid	Charm-Tex	resulted in cover peeling off
Pillowcases		Dozen	13.99	No 8id	8.90	9.64	8.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	ATD	Low Bid
Sheets, Flat, White		Dozen	26.99	40.16	29.72	29.89	27.88	No Bid	No Bid	36.43	Bob Barker	Low Bid
												product was inconsistent texture, no folded edge sampler able to
		do co	10.36	10.42	7 90	96.9	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11.96	Charm-Tex	poke finger through fabric.
Didirec, rail		Dozen	13.99	17.61	17.54	22.80	15.98	No Bid	No Bid	16.89	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Washdothe White		Dozen	1 69	No Bid	2.54	3.76	2.68	No Bid	2.27	2.93	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Garment Bass Blue w/Yellow Trim	=	Each	20.39	No Bid	22.36	No Bid	17.78	No Bid	17.94	No Bid	ATD	Low Bid
Single Blade Bazor, Orange		100/Case	4.49		5.54	5.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	65.45	Bob Barker	Low Bid
Shaving Cream		Dozen	16.49		No Bid	18.07	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15.12	Uniforms Mfg.	Low Bid